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May 12, 2023 

 

RE:  Cycle 2 Call for Projects for 2019 STMP Update Funds 

 

Dear WCCTAC TAC and Interested Parties: 

 

On March 24, 2023 WCCTAC’s Board of Directors authorized staff to release the second call for 

projects under the 2019 Subregional Transportation Mitigation Program (STMP) Update.  The 

Board made $5.3 million available.  Only projects included on the 2019 STMP Update Project List, 

attached, are eligible to receive funding.  Applications are due by August 30, 2023.   

 

The following guidelines apply to this cycle:  

 

1. Each project sponsor may submit either one or two funding applications. 

2. The total amount of funding sought by any single project sponsor should not be 

greater than $1.5M.  

 

Interested parties should submit a brief letter of interest responding to the items below along 

with any attachments in one pdf file per application.  The pdf file/s should be sent with the 

subject line “STMP Cycle 2 Submission” to jnemeth@wcctac.org and LGREENBLAT@wcctac.org.  

If two applications are submitted, those applications should each be submitted in separate 

emails.  The application letter should include the following information: 

 

• The amount of STMP funds being requested. 

• Clear identification of which of the STMP project categories the request falls under. 

• The location of the project shown on a map. 

• A brief but clear description of what the STMP funds would be used for. 

• A summary project schedule showing estimated month and year of PSE, start of 

construction, end of construction, and opening to the public.  Clearly note which phase 

of project development the STMP funds would be used for. 

• The total estimated cost of the project and/or the cost of the current project phase for 

which funds are sought.  

• The project’s current readiness to use the funds.  Provide a best estimate of the month 

and year when the funds would be spent. 

• The amount and source of other committed funding for the phase for which STMP 

funding is sought.  Please note if the STMP funds would be used to help leverage other 
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funds.   

• A description of the value that the STMP funds would provide in either advancing or 

completing the project.   

• Documentation to show that the project is located within, or will serve, a disadvantaged 

community using MTC’s Equity Priority Community designation. 

• An explanation of whether, and how, the project improves the alternative mode 

networks (e.g., pedestrian, bicycle, or transit). 

 

Schedule for Cycle 2 2019 STMP Update Call for Projects  

Task Date 

Board authorization of Call for Projects. March 24, 2023 

Meetings with TAC to review submittal requirements and 

evaluation criteria.  

April 13 & May 11 

STMP funding proposals due. August 30, 2023 

WCCTAC staff screening of proposals. Aug 30 – Sept 8 

WCCTAC TAC Reviews Proposals in TAC Packet. Sept 8-14 

WCCTAC TAC Meeting: Develop recommendation for Board. Sept 14, 2023 

WCCTAC Board makes STMP allocations.  Sept 22, 2023 

 

Applications will be initially ranked by WCCTAC staff using the criteria listed below. This 

information, along with project applications, will be provided to the WCCTAC TAC.  The TAC will 

then aim to develop a consensus funding recommendation for the WCCTAC Board. 

 

Scoring Criteria for Cycle 2 2019 STMP Update Call for Projects 

Criteria Max. Points 

Ability to spend STMP funds in the near term.   10 pts. 

Value of STMP funding to advancing the project.   10 pts. 

Serves a disadvantaged community.   5 pts. 

Improves subregional alternative mode network. 5 pts. 

 

Please email me if you have questions regarding this call for projects at  

jnemeth@wcctac.org  

 

Sincerely,  

 

 

John Nemeth 

Executive Director, WCCTAC 

 

Attachment:  2019 STMP Update Project List 

mailto:jnemeth@wcctac.org


 

STMP Projects and Estimated Costs 

ID Project Description Reported Cost 
Year of 

cost 
estimate 

Escalation 
Factor1 

Estimated 
Cost, 2018$ 

Complete Streets Projects 

1 

San Pablo 
Avenue 

Complete 
Streets 
Projects 

a.) Construct bike and 
pedestrian improvements 
along San Pablo Avenue from 
Rodeo to Crockett. 

 $8,200,000  2017 1.05 $8,610,000 

b.) Construct bicycle and 
pedestrian improvements 
along San Pablo Avenue 
between La Puerta Road and 
Hilltop Drive. 

$3,000,000  2017 1.05 $3,150,000  

c.) Construct bike, pedestrian 
and transit improvements 
along San Pablo Avenue from 
Rivers Street in San Pablo to 
Lowell Avenue in Richmond. 

$13,100,000  2017 1.05 $13,755,000 

d.) Implement Complete 
Streets improvements along 
San Pablo Avenue including 
directional cycle track or 
buffered bike lane and other 
bicycle, pedestrian and transit 
improvements in El Cerrito. 

 $7,800,000  2017 1.05 $8,190,000 

e.) San Pablo Avenue Class I 
Boardwalk between John 
Muir Parkway and Sycamore 
Avenue. 

 $296,400  2011 1.34 $398,000 

f.) Complete 
bicycle/pedestrian 
connection on San Pablo 
Avenue over Santa Fe 
Railroad tracks. 

 $16,000,000  2017 1.05 $16,800,000 

2 
Appian Way 
Complete 

Streets Project 

Provide continuous sidewalks, 
bike lanes, and improved bus 
stops along Appian Way from 
San Pablo Dam Road in 
unincorporated El Sobrante 
to about 900 lineal feet north 
of the city limit within the 
City of Pinole. 

$22,200,000 2017 1.05 $23,310,000 

3 

San Pablo 
Dam Road 

Improvements 
in Downtown 
El Sobrante 

Provide complete street 
improvements on San Pablo 
Dam Road between El Portal 
Drive and Castro Ranch Road. 

$6,900,000 2005 1.51 $10,422,000 
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Other Bicycle and Pedestrian-Focused Improvements  

4 Bay Trail Gap 
Closure 

Improve transit access by 
closing three key Bay Trail 
gaps: along Goodrick Avenue 
in Richmond, between 
Bayfront Park and Pinole 
Creek in Pinole, and between 
Atlas Road and Cypress 
Avenue in unincorporated 
Contra Costa County. 

$11,135,000  2016 1.10 $12,276,000 

5 
Ohlone 

Greenway 
Improvements 

Implement crossing, 
wayfinding, signing, lighting, 
safety, access and security, 
and landscaping 
improvements along Ohlone 
Greenway. 

$2,900,000  2017 1.05 $3,045,000 

6 

I-580/Harbour 
Way 

Interchange 
Pedestrian & 
Bicycle Access 
Improvements 

Improve pedestrian and 
bicycle crossings at the I-
580/Harbour Way 
interchange ramps. 

$386,500  2011 1.34 $519,000 

7 I-580/Marina 
Bay Parkway 

Improve pedestrian and 
bicycle crossings at the I-
580/Marina Bay Parkway 
interchance ramps 

$815,300  2011 1.34 $1,095,000 

8 

Richmond 
Ferry to 

Bridge Bicycle 
Network 

Improvements 

a.) Point Richmond area: from 
the new trail at Tewksbury & 
Castro to existing Bay Trail at 
S. Garrard & Richmond Ave.  

$1,150,000  2018 1.00 $1,150,000 

b.) Point Richmond to 
Richmond Greenway: 
including S. Garrard Blvd and 
W. Ohio Ave. 

$2,950,000  2018 1.00 $2,950,000 

c.) W. Cutting Blvd, Cutting 
Blvd, and Hoffman Blvd. $3,550,000  2018 1.00 $3,550,000 
d.) Harbour Way South: 
Hoffman Blvd to Ferry 
Terminal. 

$1,100,000  2018 1.00 $1,100,000 

Transit and Station-Related Improvements  

9 I-80 Express 
Bus 

Capital improvements 
associated with implementing 
Express Bus Service on I-80 
from Hercules south to 
Berkeley, Emeryville, Oakland, 
and expansion to San 
Francisco, with intermediate 
stops at the Richmond 
Parkway Transit Center and a 
potential I-80/Macdonald 
Avenue Express Bus/BRT 
transit center. 

$104,003,000  2017 1.05 $109,203,000 
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10 

Hercules 
Regional 

Intermodal 
Transportation 

Center 

Current phase of Hercules 
RITC is to complete 
construction of the new train 
stop for Capitol Corridor 
service, including parking, 
station platform, signage and 
plazas, rail improvements, 
bicycle and pedestrian access 
improvements (e.g. Bay Trail 
connections), etc. Future 
capital improvements could 
include preparation for ferry 
service. 

$51,000,000  2017 1.05 $53,550,000 

11 BART 
Extension 

BART extension from the 
Richmond BART Station. Only 
the planning, conceptual 
engineering and program 
level environmental clearance 
phases of the project are 
included. 

$14,000,000 2017 1.05 $14,700,000 

12 

San Pablo 
Avenue 
Transit 

Corridor 
Improvements 

Bus Rapid Transit (BRT) on 
San Pablo Avenue 
approximating the existing 
72R Rapid Bus route from 
downtown Oakland to the 
Richmond Parkway Transit 
Center and extending Rapid 
Bus from the Richmond 
Parkway Transit Center to the 
Hercules Transit Center. 

 $183,000,000  2017 1.05 $192,150,000  

13 
23rd Street 

Transit 
Corridor 

Improvements 

23rd Street BRT from 
Richmond Ferry Terminal and 
UC Berkeley Richmond Field 
Station to Richmond 
BART/Capitol Corridor 
station, then continuing to 
Contra Costa College. 

 $116,000,000  2017 1.05 $121,800,000 

14 

West County 
BART Station 

Access, 
Parking & 
Capacity 

Improvements 

a.) El Cerrito Plaza Station 
Modernization and Capacity 
Enhancements. 

$42,710,000  2015 1.16 $49,442,000  

b.) El Cerrito Plaza BART 
Pedestrian & Bike Safety and 
Access Improvements. 

$1,200,000  2017 1.05 $1,260,000 

c.) Richmond BART 
Pedestrian & Bike Safety and 
Access Improvements. 

$3,300,000  2017 1.05 $3,465,000 

d.) Richmond Crossover 
Project. $27,000,000  2012 1.29 $34,759,000  
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15 

Del Norte 
Area TOD 

Public 
Infrastructure 
Improvements 

Planning, engineering, 
environmental studies, and 
construction of the public 
transportation-related 
improvements related to 
Transit Oriented 
Development (TOD) in the 
area around the El Cerrito Del 
Norte BART station. 

 $25,000,000 2005 1.51 $37,761,000 

Local Street and Intersection Improvements  

16 

San Pablo 
Avenue 

Intersection 
Realignment 
at 23rd Street 
and Road 20 

Realignment of skewed 5-
legged intersection as part of 
a bridge removal project that 
will enhance pedestrian, 
bicycle and future BRT access. 

$14,400,000  2017 1.05 $15,120,000 

Freeway and Interchange Improvements  

17 

I-80/San 
Pablo Dam 

Road 
Interchange 

Improvements 
(Phase 2) 

Reconstruct the existing I-
80/San Pablo Dam Road 
interchange (including 
modifications to the El Portal 
Drive and McBryde Avenue 
ramps) and provide improved 
pedestrian and bicycle 
facilities. 

$80,750,000  2017 1.05 $84,788,000  

18 

I-80/Central 
Avenue 

Interchange 
Improvements 

(Phase 2) 

Improve traffic operations at 
the I-80/Central Avenue 
interchange and along 
Central Avenue between 
Rydin Road and San Pablo 
Avenue. The project will be 
completed in two phases. 

$14,500,000  2017 1.05 $15,225,000 

19 
I-80/Pinole 
Valley Road 
Interchange 

Improvements 

Improve merge onto the I-80 
mainline from the EB Pinole 
Valley Road on-ramp to 
address vehicles accelerating 
uphill after stopping at ramp 
meter, in addition to ramp-
terminal intersection 
improvements. 

$10,437,000  2017 1.05 $10,959,000 

Administrative Projects 

20 Future Nexus 
Study Updates 

Two comprehensive nexus 
studies and fee updates, over 
the 22-year planning horizon 
of the 2019 STMP Fee. 

$500,000 2018 1.00 $500,00 

Total Estimated Cost $789,283,200     $855,002,000   

Notes: 
1 Most projects have cost estimates prepared in 2011 or more recently. For those projects, the escalation factor was calculated based 
on the Annual Infrastructure Construction Cost Inflation Estimates (AICCIE) reported by OneSanfrancisco (onesanfrancisco.org).  
Two projects (projects 3 and 15) have cost estimates dating to 2005; for those projects, an index of 1.37 as specified by WCCTAC’s 
STMP model ordinance was used to escalate the costs to 2016 dollars, and then the inflation rates for years 2016 and 2017 (reported 
by onesanfrancisco.org) were used to escalate the cost to 2018 dollars. 
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